Bid Opening 10/6/10 1:00 PM Bates County |G&H Joplin Kay Pohl Vernon County |Kennon Nevada Osceola
Bid # D7-11-012 Concrete Redi-Mix Ready-Mix Concrete |Concrete Concrete |Ready Mix Ready Mix |Concrete [|Concrete
Group#
1-BARRY *NW Quarter
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25 $ 99.50
1 % Calcium $ 5.00 $ 4.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00 $ 8.00
Hot Water $ 3.00 $ 2.50
Fiber $ 5.50 $ 7.00
6 Sack $ 93.75 $ 87.00
Class B-2 Concrete $ 104.75 $ 101.00
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 174.70 $ 99.50
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00 $ 9.00
Short Load Charge $ 50.00 $ 50.00
short load short load
<3 cu yds <4 cu yds
2-BARTON
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25
1 % Calcium $ 5.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00
Hot Water $ 3.00
Fiber $ 5.50
6 Sack $ 93.75
Class B-2 Concrete $ 104.75
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 174.40
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00
Short Load Charge $ 50.00
short load
<3 cu yds

3-BATES
8 1/2 Sack $ 120.00
1 % Calcium $ 4.00
2 % Calcium $ 7.50
Hot Water $ 6.00
Fiber $ 8.50
6 Sack $ 109.00
Class B-2 Concrete No Bid
Cementitious Grout for Underseal No Bid
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 22.00
Short Load Charge $ 55.00

short load

<5 cu yds




Bates County |G&H Joplin Kay Pohl Vernon County |Kennon Nevada Osceola
Redi-Mix Ready-Mix Concrete Concrete Concrete |Ready Mix Ready Mix [Concrete |Concrete
Group#
4-CEDAR *SW Quarter
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25 $ 106.80
1 % Calcium $ 5.00 $ 5.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00 $ 10.00
Hot Water $ 3.00 $ 3.00
Fiber $ 5.50 $ 5.00
6 Sack $ 93.75 $ 91.50
Class B-2 Concrete $ 104.75 No Bid
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 174.40 $ 181.00
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00 $ 450
Short Load Charge $ 50.00 $ 35.00
short load short load
<3 cuyds <4 cuyds
5-DADE *Western Half
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25
1 % Calcium $ 5.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00
Hot Water $ 3.00
Fiber $ 5.50
6 Sack $ 93.75
Class B-2 Concrete $ 104.75
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 174.40
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00
Short Load Charge $ 50.00
short load
<3 cuyds
6-JASPER *East of 71
8 1/2 Sack $ 10725|% 95501 $% 99.50
1 % Calcium $ 500 ($ 1551| % 4.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00 | $ 310 $ 8.00
Hot Water $ 3.00 % 200 | $ 2.50
Fiber $ 550 (% 500 | $ 7.00
6 Sack $ 93.75|% 8175($ 87.00
Class B-2 Concrete $ 10475|% 89.75|$% 101.00
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 17440(% 11625( $ 99.50
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00 | $ 465 | % 9.00
Short Load Charge $ 50.00[$ 50.00|$ 50.00
short load short load | short load
<3 cu yds <3cuyds | <4cuyds




Bates County |G&H Joplin Kay Pohl Vernon County |Kennon Nevada Osceola
Redi-Mix Ready-Mix Concrete Concrete Concrete |Ready Mix Ready Mix |Concrete |Concrete
Group#
7-LAWRENCE *Western Half
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25 $ 99.50
1 % Calcium $ 5.00 $ 4.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00 $ 8.00
Hot Water $ 3.00 $ 2.50
Fiber $ 5.50 $ 7.00
6 Sack $ 93.75 $ 87.00
Class B-2 Concrete $ 104.75 $ 101.00
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 174.70 $ 99.50
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00 $ 9.00
Short Load Charge $ 50.00 $ 50.00
short load short load
<3 cuyds <4 cu yds
8-MCDONALD
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25
1 % Calcium $ 5.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00
Hot Water $ 3.00
Fiber $ 5.50
6 Sack $ 93.75
Class B-2 Concrete $ 104.75
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 174.40
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00
Short Load Charge $ 50.00
short load
<3 cu yds
9-NEWTON
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25|% 95.50
1 % Calcium $ 500 ($ 1.55
2 % Calcium $ 10.00 | $ 3.10
Hot Water $ 3.00 | % 2.00
Fiber $ 550 1| % 5.00
6 Sack $ 93.75|$% 8175
Class B-2 Concrete $ 10475 % 116.25
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 17470|3% 89.75
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00 | $ 4.65
Short Load Charge $ 50.00 | $ 50.00
short load short load
<3 cuyds <3 cu yds




Bates County |G&H Joplin Kay Pohl Vernon County |Kennon Nevada Osceola
Redi-Mix Ready-Mix Concrete Concrete Concrete |Ready Mix Ready Mix |Concrete |Concrete
Group#
10-ST. CLAIR
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.30
1 % Calcium $ 5.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00
Hot Water $ 3.00
Fiber $ 5.00
6 Sack $ 92.00
Class B-2 Concrete N/A
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 182.00
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 450
Short Load Charge $ 35.00
short load
<4 cuyds
11-VERNON *Southern Half
8 1/2 Sack $ 107.25 $ 99.00 | $ 109.00 $ 105.80
1 % Calcium $ 5.00 $ 200(% 3.00 $ 5.00
2 % Calcium $ 10.00 $ 400(%$ 6.00 $ 10.00
Hot Water $ 3.00 $ 225(% 4.00 $ 3.00
Fiber $ 5.50 $ 500(% 6.50 $ 5.00
6 Sack $ 93.75 $ 89.00( % 95.00 $ 90.50
Class B-2 Concrete $ 104.75 $ 97.00( % 107.00 No Bld
Cementitious Grout for Underseal $ 174.70 NoBid |5 99.00 $ 180.00
Non-Chloride Accelerant $ 10.00 $ 850 No Bid $ 450
Short Load Charge $ 50.00 N/C $ 30.00 $ 35.00
short load short load short load
<3 cuyds <3 cuyds <4 cuyds

*DELIVERY STIPULATIONS

An asterick designates a stipulation
for delivery in that specific

county.

Contact Information on
following page.




1CONTACT INFORMATION

Bates County Redi-Mix
660-679-5752

G&H Ready-Mix
417-623-4760

Joplin 417-781-6160
Neosho 417-451-0055
Carthage 417-781-6160
Lamar 417-682-6120

Joplin Concrete
417-624-4366
417-624-5829

Kay Concrete

Aurora 417-678-3477
Monett 417-235-3628
Mt.Vernon 417-466-2700
Sarcoxie 417-548-2432

Pohl Concrete
417-667-6022

Vernon County Ready Mix
417-667-5080

Kennon Ready Mix
417-876-4121

Nevada Concrete
417-667-8622

Osceola Concrete
417-646-2317




