
D7-09-060A
Bid Tabulations

Item No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

001 5' x 3' MoDOT Type T Curb Inlet 3 EA $909.00 $2,727.00 $1,836.00 $5,508.00

002 5' x 4' MoDOT Type T Curb Inlet 1 EA $1,079.00 $1,079.00 $1,886.00 $1,886.00

003 5' x 5' MoDOT Type T Curb Inlet 7 EA $1,149.00 $8,043.00 $1,945.00 $13,615.00

004 5' x 6' MoDOT Type T Curb Inlet 7 EA $1,339.00 $9,373.00 $1,998.00 $13,986.00

005 8' x 4' MoDOT Type X Curb Inlet 1 EA $660.00 $660.00 NO BID $0.00

006

8' x 4' MoDOT Type X Curb Inlet W/ Angle 
Wall-Cast or Pre-Cast

1 EA

NO BID- 
Recommends 
Cast in Place $0.00 NO BID $0.00

007 18" RCP 18 LF $12.04 $216.72 $13.00 $234.00

008 36" RCP 162 LF $40.06 $6,489.72 $38.00 $6,156.00

009 48" RCP 187 LF $60.06 $11,231.22 $62.00 $11,594.00

010 8' x 6' MoDOT Type X Curb Inlet 1 EA $660.00 $660.00 NO BID $0.00

011

15' x 6' MoDOT Type X Curb Inlet W/ 
Angle Wall-Cast or Pre-Cast

1 EA

NO BID- 
Recommends 
Cast in Place $0.00 NO BID $0.00

Total $40,479.66 $52,979.00

Optional Products

    Scurlocks DuraKast 
Low 
Bid


