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Price Per Month $ | $ 520.00 | Non Responsive | $ 476.67| $ 700.00 | $ 397.50 No Bid No Bid
First Renewal Period | $ 550.00 | Non Responsive | $ 500.50 | $ 730.00 | $ 397.50 No Bid No Bid
Second Renewal Period| $ 580.00 | Non Responsive | $ 52553 $ 750.00 | $ 397.50 No Bid No Bid
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Price Per Month $ |$ 520.00 ] Non Responsive | $ 509.67 No Bid $ 397.50 No Bid No Bid
First Renewal Period | $ 550.00 ] Non Responsive | $ 535.15 No Bid $ 397.50 No Bid No Bid
Second Renewal Period| $ 580.00 | Non Responsive | $ 561.91 No Bid $ 397.50 No Bid No Bid
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